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While feminist legal scholarship has thrived within universities and in some sectors of legal practice, it has
yet to have much impact within the judiciary, or on judicial thinking. Thus, while feminist legal scholarship
has generated comprehensive critiques of existing legal doctrine, there has been little opportunity to test or
apply feminist knowledge in practice in the decisions of individual cases. In this unique and thought-
provoking book, a group of feminist legal scholars put theory into practice in judgment form by writing the
'missing' feminist judgments in key cases. The cases chosen are significant decisions in English law across a
broad range of substantive areas. The cases originate from a variety of levels, but are primarily opinions of
the UK's Court of Appeal or the House of Lords. In some instances, they are written in a fictitious appeal,
but in others they are written as an additional concurring or dissenting judgment in the original case,
providing a powerful illustration of the way in which the case could have been decided differently, even at
the time it was heard. Each case is accompanied by a commentary which renders the judgment accessible to
a non-specialist audience. The commentary explains the original decision, its background and doctrinal
significance, the issues it raises, and how the feminist judgment deals with them differently. The book also
includes chapters examining the theoretical and conceptual issues raised by the process and practice of
feminist judging, and by the judgments themselves, including the possibility of divergent feminist
approaches to legal decision-making.
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From reader reviews:

Martina Joseph:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled Feminist Judgments: From Theory to Practice. Try to face the book Feminist
Judgments: From Theory to Practice as your friend. It means that it can being your friend when you really
feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned in
your case. The book makes you more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So ,
we need to make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Carlo Young:

This Feminist Judgments: From Theory to Practice tend to be reliable for you who want to certainly be a
successful person, why. The reason why of this Feminist Judgments: From Theory to Practice can be one of
many great books you must have is giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed you with
information that perhaps will shock your prior knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it
everywhere and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed types. Beside that this Feminist
Judgments: From Theory to Practice giving you an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary,
giving you trial of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and
revel in reading.

Rebecca Bailey:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just
watching TV, or even playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that is look
different you can read the book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can
spent all day long to reading a book. The book Feminist Judgments: From Theory to Practice it is quite good
to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book.
Should you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore
easily to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book possesses
high quality.

Irma Chavez:

A lot of people said that they feel bored when they reading a publication. They are directly felt this when
they get a half elements of the book. You can choose the book Feminist Judgments: From Theory to Practice
to make your personal reading is interesting. Your skill of reading expertise is developing when you such as
reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the idea about book and looking
at especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to wide open a book and go through it. Beside that the
book Feminist Judgments: From Theory to Practice can to be your brand new friend when you're experience



alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of the time.
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