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Student-directed IEPs are quickly gaining momentum in schools across the country—the proven benefits
include higher academic achievement, enhanced student motivation, and increased communication and self-
advocacy skills for students with disabilities. Now for the first time, there's a book that gives elementary and
high school educators in-depth how-to guidance on making student-directed IEPs work for students with a
range of special needs.

Packed with practical advice, helpful examples, and IEP resources for students themselves, this cutting-edge
guidebook finally puts into print the best ideas for developing meaningful student-directed IEPs while
adhering to legal requirements and evidence-based practices. Teachers will learn how to support
students—regardless of their current skills and abilities—as they increase their own level of direction across
every facet of the IEP process:

articulating strengths, needs, and legal rights●

setting clear goals and evaluating progress●

advocating effectively for themselves in formal settings●

determining and securing appropriate accommodations●

communicating preferences and interests●

accepting responsibility for areas where improvement is needed●

participating fully in discussions about post-school plans and needs●

Destined to elevate future standards for the IEP process, this compelling and accessible book will help
teachers ensure customized, highly effective educational plans for students of all ages. Teachers will
empower students to take a lead role in directing their education, advocating for support, and shaping a
bright, self-determined future.

Bring students into the IEP process with

More than 100 quick tips and practical strategies from teacher focus groups●

Step-by-step guidance for increasing student involvement at any level●

A wide range of case studies featuring students from ages 9–19●

Helpful big-picture view of IEPs across 7 stages—from school-directed to student-directed●
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From reader reviews:

Rene Defeo:

Here thing why this kind of Getting the Most Out of IEPs: An Educator's Guide to the Student-Directed
Approach are different and trusted to be yours. First of all reading through a book is good but it really
depends in the content of it which is the content is as delightful as food or not. Getting the Most Out of IEPs:
An Educator's Guide to the Student-Directed Approach giving you information deeper including different
ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no publication that similar with Getting the Most
Out of IEPs: An Educator's Guide to the Student-Directed Approach. It gives you thrill looking at journey,
its open up your eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around
you. You can bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your way home by train. If you are having
difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Getting the Most Out of IEPs: An Educator's
Guide to the Student-Directed Approach in e-book can be your substitute.

Tracy Zapata:

This book untitled Getting the Most Out of IEPs: An Educator's Guide to the Student-Directed Approach to
be one of several books which best seller in this year, that's because when you read this guide you can get a
lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy that book in the book shop or you can order it by means of online.
The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, because you can read
this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this guide from your list.

Raymond Murray:

The particular book Getting the Most Out of IEPs: An Educator's Guide to the Student-Directed Approach
has a lot details on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was compiled by the
very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research just before write this book. This kind of book very easy
to read you will get the point easily after scanning this book.

Alva Stephenson:

As we know that book is important thing to add our understanding for everything. By a book we can know
everything you want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This book Getting the Most Out of IEPs: An Educator's Guide to the Student-
Directed Approach was filled about science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your
science competence. Some people has different feel when they reading a book. If you know how big
advantage of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to
get book you wanted.
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