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This book considers the origins, performance and diffusion of national immigration policies targeting highly
skilled immigrants. Unlike asylum seekers and immigrants admitted under family reunification streams,
highly skilled immigrants are typically cast as “wanted and welcome” as a consequence of their potential
economic contribution to the receiving society and putative assimilability. Testing the degree to which this
assumption holds is the principle aim of this book. In contrast to publications which see highly skilled
immigration as functional response to labor market needs, the book probes the political and sociological
dimensions of policy, drawing on contributions from an international group of established and new scholars
from the fields of history, law, political science, sociology, and public policy. The book is organized into
four parts. Part I probes the origins of post-WWII immigration policies in Canada, Australia, and the United
States. Part II analyzes recent debates on highly skilled immigration policy in the United States, whose
origins go back to the 1965 Act by Congress which favored family reunification over skilled immigration.
Part III considers the degree to which highly skilled immigrants are welcome, by focusing on the integration
trajectories of foreign trained professionals in Canada. Paradoxically, just as Canada has succeeded in
orienting its admissions system more explicitly toward privileging highly educated and skilled professionals,
highly skilled immigrants have experienced worsening economic outcomes as reflected in rates of
unemployment and falling earnings. Part IV considers the internationalization of highly skilled immigration
policies, focusing on Europe’s most important immigration countries, Germany and Britain. As is true in
Canada, the labor market outcomes for highly skilled immigrants in Europe are disappointing, and the final
chapter discusses why this is the case and what might be done to improve matters. Given its combination of
cross-disciplinary insights, cross-national comparisons, and empirical richness, the book will be of interest to
both scholars and policymakers concerned with immigration policy.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Bax:

The publication with title Wanted and Welcome?: Policies for Highly Skilled Immigrants in Comparative
Perspective (Immigrants and Minorities, Politics and Policy) has lot of information that you can learn it. You
can get a lot of profit after read this book. This specific book exist new knowledge the information that exist
in this publication represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how
the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you with new era of the the positive effect. You
can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Elizabeth Blake:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them loved ones or
their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or even
playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read
a new book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent 24
hours a day to reading a publication. The book Wanted and Welcome?: Policies for Highly Skilled
Immigrants in Comparative Perspective (Immigrants and Minorities, Politics and Policy) it is very good to
read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book.
When you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore
quickly to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book offers high quality.

Lena Lewis:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get lots
of stress from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely
indeed. People is human not a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you have when the
spare time coming to you of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one, reading
ebooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the actual book you have read is actually
Wanted and Welcome?: Policies for Highly Skilled Immigrants in Comparative Perspective (Immigrants and
Minorities, Politics and Policy).

Danielle Burdette:

A lot of guide has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is named of
book Wanted and Welcome?: Policies for Highly Skilled Immigrants in Comparative Perspective
(Immigrants and Minorities, Politics and Policy). Contain your knowledge by it. Without making the printed
book, it may add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most essential that, you must
aware about book. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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