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Leo never imagined that time travel might really be possible, or that the objects in H. G. Wells’ science
fiction novels might actually exist. But then a miniature time machine appears in Leo’s bedroom, and he
recognizes one of the tiny riders: himself! His search for the time machine and his fate leads him to the New-
York Circulating Material Repository, a magical library that lends out objects instead of books. Hidden away
in the Repository basement is the Wells Bequest, a secret collection of powerful objects straight out of
classic science fiction novels: robots, rockets, submarines, a shrink ray—and one very famous time machine.
And when Leo’s adventure of a lifetime suddenly turns deadly, he must attempt a journey to 1895 to warn
real-life scientist Nikola Tesla about a dangerous invention. A race for time is on!
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From reader reviews:

Carol Shull:

Now a day those who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each details they get. How many people
to be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information specifically this The Wells Bequest: A
Companion to The Grimm Legacy book as this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the info
in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Michael Sheridan:

The particular book The Wells Bequest: A Companion to The Grimm Legacy will bring someone to the new
experience of reading a new book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. If you try to find new
book you just read, this book very suited to you. The book The Wells Bequest: A Companion to The Grimm
Legacy is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so
you can more readily to read the book.

Maureen Smiley:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book technique, more simple and reachable. This particular The Wells Bequest: A Companion to The Grimm
Legacy can give you a lot of close friends because by you looking at this one book you have thing that they
don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of a step for you to get
success. This publication offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't know, by knowing more
than various other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We should have The Wells
Bequest: A Companion to The Grimm Legacy.

Ann Craft:

A lot of book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by internet on social media. You
can choose the top book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is
known as of book The Wells Bequest: A Companion to The Grimm Legacy. You can include your
knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make you happier to
read. It is most essential that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one location to other
place.
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