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Isherwood's final work of fiction?an epistolary novel that explores sexual identity and Eastern
mysticism

After a long separation, two English brothers meet in India. Oliver, the idealistic younger brother, prepares to
take his final vows as a Hindu monk. Patrick, a successful publisher with a wife and children in London and
a male lover in California, has publicly admired his brother's convictions while privately criticizing his
choices.
First published in 1967, A Meeting by the River delicately depicts the complexity of sibling relationships?the
resentment and competitiveness as well as the love and respect. Ultimately, the brothers' exposure to each
other's differences deepens their awareness of themselves. In A Meeting by the River, Christopher Isherwood
dramatizes the conflict between sexuality and spirituality that inspired his late writings.
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From reader reviews:

Wendy Brame:

Inside other case, little persons like to read book A Meeting by the River: A Novel (FSG Classics). You can
choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. As long as we know about how is important the book A
Meeting by the River: A Novel (FSG Classics). You can add information and of course you can around the
world by a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can learn everything! From your country
until foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple issue until wonderful thing it is possible to know
that. In this era, we are able to open a book or even searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You
should use it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's examine.

Helen Arnold:

The book A Meeting by the River: A Novel (FSG Classics) can give more knowledge and also the precise
product information about everything you want. Why must we leave the great thing like a book A Meeting
by the River: A Novel (FSG Classics)? A few of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim
that will book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer using your book.
Knowledge or details that you take for that, you can give for each other; you are able to share all of these.
Book A Meeting by the River: A Novel (FSG Classics) has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great
and large function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by open and read a e-book. So it is very
wonderful.

Janelle Garrity:

Reading a book tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their particular reader with their story
or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the books. But also they write about the
ability about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children,
there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their ability in
writing, they also doing some investigation before they write with their book. One of them is this A Meeting
by the River: A Novel (FSG Classics).

Linda Fite:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This particular book A Meeting by the River: A Novel (FSG Classics)
was colourful and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book A Meeting by the River: A Novel
(FSG Classics) has many kinds or style. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Private eye
Conan you can read and think that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are generally
make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for you and
try to like reading this.
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