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With the insights she has gleaned from her close and subtle observation of parent-teacher conferences,
renowned Harvard University professor Sara Lawrence-Lightfoot has written a wise, useful book about the
ways in which parents and teachers can make the most of their essential conversation—the dialogue between
the most vital people in a child’s life.

“The essential conversation” is the crucial exchange that occurs between parents and teachers—a dialogue
that takes place more than one hundred million times a year across our country and is both mirror of and
metaphor for the larger cultural forces that define family-school relationships and shape the development of
our children. Participating in this twice-yearly ritual, so friendly and benign in its apparent goals, parents and
teachers are often wracked with anxiety. In a meeting marked by decorum and politeness, they frequently
exhibit wariness and assume defensive postures. Even though the conversation appears to be focused on the
student, adults may find themselves playing out their own childhood histories, insecurities, and fears.

Through vivid portraits and parables, Sara Lawrence-Lightfoot captures the dynamics of this complex,
intense relationship from the perspective of both parents and teachers. She also identifies new principles and
practices for improving family-school relationships. In a voice that combines the passion of a mother, the
skepticism of a social scientist, and the keen understanding of one of our nation’s most admired educators,
Lawrence-Lightfoot offers penetrating analysis and an urgent call to arms for all those who want to act in the
best interests of their children.

For parents and teachers who seek productive dialogues and collaborative alliances in support of the learning
and growth of their children, this book will offer valuable insights, incisive lessons, and deft guidance on
how to communicate more effectively. In The Essential Conversation, Sara Lawrence-Lightfoot brings
scholarship, warmth, and wisdom to an immensely important cultural subject—the way we raise our
children.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Leo Rizer:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading practice
give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information
inside the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind
of e-book you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want
experience happy read one together with theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The actual The Essential
Conversation: What Parents and Teachers Can Learn from Each Other is kind of e-book which is giving the
reader erratic experience.

Serafina Hayes:

The book The Essential Conversation: What Parents and Teachers Can Learn from Each Other has a lot of
information on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was
compiled by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research previous to write this book.
This particular book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after reading this book.

Donald Hidalgo:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This book The Essential Conversation: What Parents and Teachers
Can Learn from Each Other was multi-colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book
The Essential Conversation: What Parents and Teachers Can Learn from Each Other has many kinds or
genre. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and think
you are the character on there. So , not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it offers you feel
happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading that will.

Larry Dolin:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information coming from a book. Book is composed or printed or highlighted from each source that filled
update of news. Within this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for a
person. From media social just like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book,
story and comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open
your book? Or just seeking the The Essential Conversation: What Parents and Teachers Can Learn from
Each Other when you essential it?
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