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This book presents a comprehensive overview of the sum rule approach to spectral analysis of orthogonal
polynomials, which derives from Gábor Szego's classic 1915 theorem and its 1920 extension. Barry Simon
emphasizes necessary and sufficient conditions, and provides mathematical background that until now has
been available only in journals. Topics include background from the theory of meromorphic functions on
hyperelliptic surfaces and the study of covering maps of the Riemann sphere with a finite number of slits
removed. This allows for the first book-length treatment of orthogonal polynomials for measures supported
on a finite number of intervals on the real line.

In addition to the Szego and Killip-Simon theorems for orthogonal polynomials on the unit circle (OPUC)
and orthogonal polynomials on the real line (OPRL), Simon covers Toda lattices, the moment problem, and
Jacobi operators on the Bethe lattice. Recent work on applications of universality of the CD kernel to obtain
detailed asymptotics on the fine structure of the zeros is also included. The book places special emphasis on
OPRL, which makes it the essential companion volume to the author's earlier books on OPUC.
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From reader reviews:

Leonard Parnell:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You
will see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. Often the book that recommended to
your account is Szego's Theorem and Its Descendants: Spectral Theory for L2 Perturbations of Orthogonal
Polynomials (Porter Lectures) this book consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now.
This particular book was represented how can the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer
require to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some study when he makes this book. That is
why this book ideal all of you.

Clarence Riley:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our expertise for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This book Szego's Theorem and Its Descendants: Spectral Theory for L2
Perturbations of Orthogonal Polynomials (Porter Lectures) was filled regarding science. Spend your free
time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has diverse feel when they
reading a book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a publication.
In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you wanted.

Patsy Hall:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library or to make
summary for some guide, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's internal or real their
hobby. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to at this time there but
nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring in addition to can't
see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As
we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this Szego's Theorem and Its Descendants: Spectral Theory for L2
Perturbations of Orthogonal Polynomials (Porter Lectures) can make you experience more interested to read.

Juan Turgeon:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got students? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And also you
know that little person just like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You have to know that
reading is very important and also book as to be the point. Book is important thing to add you knowledge,
except your current teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update concerning something by book.



Numerous books that can you take to be your object. One of them is niagra Szego's Theorem and Its
Descendants: Spectral Theory for L2 Perturbations of Orthogonal Polynomials (Porter Lectures).
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