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For a mother, life comes down to a series of choices.

To hold on…

To let go..

To forget…

To forgive…

Which road will you take?

Night Road

For eighteen years, Jude Farraday has put her children's needs above her own, and it shows?her twins, Mia
and Zach?are bright and happy teenagers. When Lexi Baill moves into their small, close knit community, no
one is more welcoming than Jude. Lexi, a former foster child with a dark past, quickly becomes Mia's best
friend. Then Zach falls in love with Lexi and the three become inseparable.

Jude does everything to keep her kids on track for college and out of harm's way. It has always been easy--
until senior year of high school. Suddenly she is at a loss. Nothing feels safe anymore; every time her kids
leave the house, she worries about them.

On a hot summer's night her worst fears come true. One decision will change the course of their lives. In the
blink of an eye, the Farraday family will be torn apart and Lexi will lose everything. In the years that follow,
each must face the consequences of that single night and find a way to forget…or the courage to forgive.

Vivid, universal, and emotionally complex, NIGHT ROAD raises profound questions about motherhood,
identity, love, and forgiveness. It is a luminous, heartbreaking novel that captures both the exquisite pain of
loss and the stunning power of hope. This is Kristin Hannah at her very best, telling an unforgettable story
about the longing for family, the resilience of the human heart, and the courage it takes to forgive the people
we love.
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From reader reviews:

Carol Williams:

The knowledge that you get from Night Road may be the more deep you searching the information that hide
inside the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to
recognise but Night Road giving you buzz feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in specific way
that can be understood simply by anyone who read the item because the author of this reserve is well-known
enough. That book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can
go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having this Night Road
instantly.

Tracy Cluck:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the concept Night Road
suitable to you? The book was written by popular writer in this era. Often the book untitled Night Roadis the
main of several books that everyone read now. This particular book was inspired a lot of people in the world.
When you read this publication you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know prior to. The
author explained their strategy in the simple way, consequently all of people can easily to know the core of
this guide. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. So you can see the represented
of the world within this book.

Richard Daniels:

The e-book with title Night Road posesses a lot of information that you can study it. You can get a lot of help
after read this book. This particular book exist new understanding the information that exist in this reserve
represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement
of the world. This particular book will bring you in new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-
book with your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Steven Jones:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Attempt to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't judge book by its include may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside seem likes.
Maybe you answer is usually Night Road why because the fantastic cover that make you consider with
regards to the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or even
cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly show you to pick up this book.
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