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Summary

Spring in Action, Fourth Edition is a hands-on guide to the Spring Framework, updated for version 4. It
covers the latest features, tools, and practices including Spring MVC, REST, Security, Web Flow, and more.
You'll move between short snippets and an ongoing example as you learn to build simple and efficient J2EE
applications. Author Craig Walls has a special knack for crisp and entertaining examples that zoom in on the
features and techniques you really need.

Purchase of the print book includes a free eBook in PDF, Kindle, and ePub formats from Manning
Publications.

About the Technology

Designed in 2003 as a lighter approach to J2EE development, Spring Framework has since become a
standard choice for building enterprise applications and required knowledge for Java developers. Spring 4,
the latest major version, provides full Java 8 integration along with key upgrades like new annotations for the
IoC container, improvements to Spring Expression Language, and much-needed support for REST. Whether
you're just discovering Spring or you want to absorb the new features, there's no better way to master Spring
than with this book.

About the Book

Spring in Action, Fourth Edition is a hands-on guide to the Spring Framework. It covers Spring core, along
with the latest updates to Spring MVC, Security, Web Flow, and more. You'll move between short snippets
and an ongoing example as you learn to build simple and efficient JEE applications. Author Craig Walls has
a special knack for crisp and entertaining examples that zoom in on the features and techniques you really
need.

Nearly 100,000 developers have used this book to learn Spring! It requires a working knowledge of Java.

What's Inside

Updated for Spring 4●

Spring Data for NoSQL●

Simplifying configuration with annotations and definition profiles●

Working with RESTful resources●

About the Author

Craig Walls is a software developer at Pivotal. He's a popular author and a frequent speaker at user groups
and conferences. Craig lives in Cross Roads, Texas.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Caron:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing
for us to find out everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim as well as goal; it means that e-book
has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are
really reading whatever they have because their hobby is usually reading a book. What about the person who
don't like looking at a book? Sometime, individual feel need book after they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you will want this Spring in Action.

James Hibner:

This book untitled Spring in Action to be one of several books this best seller in this year, that's because
when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this specific book in
the book retailer or you can order it by using online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes
you more readily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason
for your requirements to past this publication from your list.

Darlene Goins:

You may spend your free time to learn this book this e-book. This Spring in Action is simple to create you
can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not include much space to bring the
actual printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save the
particular book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this
book.

Donald Burgess:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a publication we can
know everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This reserve Spring in Action was filled concerning science. Spend your time to
add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading a new
book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era
like now, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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